
FORM 26 
THE PATENT ACT, 1970 

(39 of 1970) 
& 

THE PATENT RULES, 2003 
[FORM FOR AUTHORIZATION OF A PATENT AGENT/OR ANY 
PERSON IN A MATTER OF PROCEEDING UNDER THE ACT] 

(Sections 127 and 132; Rule 135) 
 

We, NAME OF THE COMPANY, a company duly incorporated in 
accordance with the laws of NAME OF THE COUNTRY and having its 
Registered Office at COMPLETE POSTAL ADDRESS hereby appoint and 
authorize Mr. Chander M. Lall, Dr. Anju Khanna, Mr. Raghav Malik, Ms. 
Tia Malik, Mr. G. Rahul, Ms. Jyotideep Kaur, Mr. Pankaj Aseri and Mr. 
Mohit Kumar Choudhary Advocates and agents of Lall & Sethi, D-17, 
South Extension Part II, New Delhi – 110 049 to act on our behalf in 
connection with all matters pertaining to grant of patent, renewals, 
oppositions, amendments or any other proceedings arising therefrom 
including signing and filing patent applications, written statements, reply 
statements, affidavits in evidence, interlocutory applications, renewals, 
assignments and any other applications or petitions, filing appeals, 
review, revisions and any other documents as may be required and to 
appear in all forums including Courts, Tribunals, Appellate Board, 
Registry, Commissions or any other special statutory authority and to 
attend to all hearings, engage agents/attorney(s) for doing the above 
mentioned acts and do any other things as may be required to be done in 
the registration/renewals/rectification proceedings pertaining to our patent 
application number 5468/DELNP/2006, titled “A Method For 
Synchronizing An Induction Generator Of An Orc Plant To A Grid” in 
India. 
 
We request that all notices, requisitions and communication relating 
thereto may be sent to such person at the above address unless 
otherwise specified. 
 
We hereby revoke all previous authorization, if any made, in respect of 
same matter or proceeding. 
 
We hereby assent to the action already taken by the said person in the 
above-matter. 
 
 

SIGNATURE 
(NAME) 

       DESIGNATION 
       OFFICIAL SEAL 
             
Dated this  Day of  2013 
 
To 
 
The Controller of Patents 
The Patent Office 
At New Delhi 
 


